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Bounty Contract Weeks can be found in
the "Weekly Activities" tab in the Bazaar.
Upon completion, the contract key will be

available for all other players, and a
message will be sent out to other players
telling them of the contract. [207] Players
who accept a contract are automatically
given a number of credits to spend on

bounties, which are stored in the "Bounty
Credit" tab of the Importers' Guild Fleet.

[297] Players may then purchase a
bounty contract key through the Bazaar,
which they then must be able to redeem

within three days to complete the
contract. The purchase options differ

depending on the bounty contract, but
usually include one of the following: a
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week of game time; a modification to the
contract; a bounty; an assassination

mission; a work order; a contract key; or
"All of the above." [297] Over one million
subscribers registered in the first three

days following The Old Republic's release,
and over a million had begun to play The
Old Republic by December 26, making it

the fastest-growing subscription MMORPG
in history. The Old Republic has received
generally positive reviews from critics,

with a score of 85 on the review
aggregation website Metacritic, though it
has received some criticism by players for
the lack of late-game content, which has

led the game's developers to focus on the
addition of upper-level content in many of

their updates. Due to declining
subscription numbers during the summer
of 2012, The Old Republic introduced a
Free-to-Play option in November 2012,
and the game's first digital expansion,
Rise of the Hutt Cartel, was released in

April 2013. The Old Republic has received
several dozens major content updates so

far, and the second Digital Expansion,
Galactic Starfighter, was released to free-
to-play users in February 2014. Galactic
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Starfighter was released to active
subscribers on December 3, 2013, and

was released to Preferred Status players
on January 14. A third Digital Expansion,

Galactic Strongholds, was released in
August 2014, and a fourth expansion,

Shadow of Revan, was released on
December 9. With the next two digital

expansions: Knights of the Fallen Empire (
October 27, 2015 ), and Knights of the

Eternal Throne ( December 2, 2016 ), the
game took a narrative twist, focusing on a
new faction, the Eternal Empire. On April

13, 2019, it was announced that a
seventh expansion would be coming to
the game, titled Onslaught. Onslaught

was released on October 22, 2019.
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The Old Republic: House of the Jedi was
released on December 10, 2013 with
Game Update 2.4. Though the patch

contained no new content, it was
intended to improve the game's stability
and performance for players. The update

also included two new option screens,
one that allowed players to opt out of the

Cartel Coins event, and the other that
allowed players who had the "experience
return bonus" applied to their account (a
system that automatically increases the

experience gained from missions to 3.25x
the normal rate) to have the bonus

replaced with Cartel Coins. Players who
had the "treasure return bonus" active (a
system that automatically increases the
amount of credits received from treasure
chests) were also able to have the bonus
removed. [30] The Rebel Assault Trooper
class is the primary ranged class for the
Rebel faction, and utilizes a variety of
sniper-style weaponry. These players

initially choose between a Human,
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Mirialan, Mandalorian, and Zabrak before
the release of Update 1.2, and the two

advanced classes for the Trooper are the
Vanguard and the Commando. Vanguard
players are classified as Ranged Tanks or

Close-Quarters Damage, and are
equipped with sniper rifles, melee
weapons, and shield generators.

Commando players are classified as
either Ranged Damage or Healer, and

they carry assault rifles as their primary
weapon. The two advanced classes share

the Assault Specialist skill tree, which
teaches the use of explosives and

grenades, and the Commando's Tactics
and Shield Specialist trees deal with close-
range combat and shielding respectively.
For the Vanguard, the Combat Medic tree
boosts healing abilities, and the Gunnery
tree aids in maximizing the damage dealt

by rifles and power bombs. The Rebel
Trooper class's five companions are Ace,
Anakin Solo, Emperor Palpatine, Hondo

Ohnaka, and Jango Fett. [55] 5ec8ef588b
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